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Canadian Chiropractic Guideline Initiative for effective 
knowledge translation

Despite existing clinical prac-
tice guidelines for optimal 
management of axial spine 

pain,1-4 the degree of adherence across 
different health care disciplines var-
ies widely.2,5-7 Known gaps between 
guidelines and routine health care 
practice reflect a universal need for 
more effective knowledge transla-
tion.8,9 Particularly in primary care, 
effective knowledge translation strat-
egies must consider the constraints 
faced by busy practitioners, including 
personal and organizational barriers 
to change. Targeted clinicians must 
also be convinced that study patients, 
from whom the data originate, are 
sufficiently representative of patients 
in their real-world practices. 

Since knowledge translation of-
ten requires changes in clinicians’ be-
liefs and behavior, strategies should 
be based on explanatory frameworks 
explicitly recognizing the psycho-
logical determinants of behavior 
change.10 With this in mind, chiro-
practic researchers have used the 
Theoretical Domains Framework 
(TDF) to inform the design of inter-
ventions aimed specifically at chang-
ing practice behavior,11,12 and en-
couraging better adherence to neck 
pain clinical practice guidelines.13 In 
keeping with the TDF approach, chi-
ropractors’ beliefs about managing 
nonspecific neck pain were evaluated 
and their facilitators and barriers to 
implementing guidelines in routine 
practice were identified. These de-
terminants of behavior change were 
then mapped to key theoretical do-
mains of behavior change. Subse-
quently, relevant domain-specific 

behavior change techniques (from 
the literature) were selected to incor-
porate into a comprehensive knowl-
edge translation package.13 The pro-
posed intervention includes (but is 
not limited to) problem-based webi-
nars to promote active learning and 
enhance knowledge and skills, edu-
cational videos by respected opinion 
leaders to leverage social influence 
and promote modeling of expert be-
havior, and evidence summaries and 
practice tool kits to enhance the en-
vironmental context and available re-
sources within private offices. Soon 
researchers will undertake a careful-
ly designed cluster randomized trial 
to evaluate the effectiveness of their  
intervention package.14

Knowledge translation is a priori-
ty of chiropractic policymakers and is 
supported by every chiropractic regu-
latory and professional membership 
organization in Canada. More than 
a decade ago the Clinical Practice 
Guidelines Initiative was launched by 
both the Canadian Chiropractic Asso-
ciation and the Canadian Federation of 
Chiropractic Regulatory and Educa-
tional Accrediting Boards.15 Its ongo-
ing mission is to improve chiroprac-
tic care delivery in Canada through 
the development, dissemination, and 
effective implementation of clini-
cal practice guidelines. The initiative 
recognizes busy clinicians often find 
it challenging to access the latest sci-
entific evidence, let alone digest and 
implement it during routine practice. 
Therefore, through a dedicated web-
site, clinicians are now provided with 
easy access to information promot-
ing adherence to evidenced-informed 
practice, and contact information for 
22 national chiropractic opinion lead-
ers and more than 100 best-practices 
collaborators who are available to 

meet with private practitioners on 
demand.16 

An extension of the initiative is 
the Canadian Chiropractic Practice-
Based Research Network, involving 
partnerships between academic insti-
tutions, researchers, and community- 
based practitioners. In BC, chiroprac-
tors participate in systematic data 
collection while providing evidence-
based education, exercises, and man-
ual therapy to patients referred by a 
medical spine physician or surgeon. 
This participatory research setting 
allows investigators to formulate 
study hypotheses directly informed 
by experiences of grassroots clini-
cians while simultaneously engaging 
and educating clinicians in hypothe-
sis-testing, and knowledge creation 
and implementation activities. 

By definition practice guidelines 
and research networks aim to define 
credible benchmarks for care based 
on the best available scientific evi-
dence, broad consensus among stake-
holders, and efficient use of health 
care resources. In chiropractic, uni-
versal support of these initiatives is 
a significant achievement and testa-
ment to the profession’s commitment 
to the principles and objectives of evi-
dence-informed health care.

—Jeffrey A. Quon, DC, MHSc, 
PhD, FCCSC

WorkSafeBC Chiropractic 
Consultant
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college library

The ClinicalKey mobile app for  
iOS and Android and the 
web-based version are avail-

able to all College registrants with 
Library access. ClinicalKey provides 
access to Elsevier’s extensive collec-
tion of medical journals, books, vid-
eos, patient education materials, and 
drug monographs. It is coupled with 
a Medline search engine and guide-
line database, making it a powerful 
research tool. The College Library’s 

ClinicalKey is mobile
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ClinicalKey subscription focuses on 
full-text content in family medicine, 
psychiatry, internal medicine, ortho-
pedics, pediatrics, obstetrics and gy-
necology, and emergency medicine. 

The ClinicalKey app contains 
essentially the same content as the 
web version while offering the con-
venience of functioning without 
an Internet connection. Users can 
browse material or search using the 
simple, intuitive search box. The 
breadth of results can be filtered 
quickly by limiting to formats such as 
books, articles, or clinical trials, pro-
cedural videos, or by specialty. The 
app also remembers search activity 

to facilitate retrieval of previous lists 
of search results, and content can be 
placed in a saved-content folder to 
create a personal archive.

The app is not technically perfect 
yet; our testing identified some dis-
play and search features that do not 
work consistently. We are in commu-
nication with Elsevier’s technical ser-
vices team to improve this resource. 
For assistance with the ClinicalKey 
mobile app, please contact the 
Library at either medlib@cpsbc.ca or 
604 733-6671.

—Karen MacDonell, PhD, MLIS
Director, Library Services
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